BID NO. 0910736 BD APP JUN 2 2 20101E SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA

BREAD FOR CHAMP'S CAFE

DUE/OPEN: May 26, 2010, 1:30 P.M.

ITEM Flowers Baking Co. of
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION Bradenton Interstate Bakeries Corp St. Armands Baking Company
Vendor Location: ——» 2 2 2
1 Bread, Honey Wheat, Enriched, Sliced. Wrapped loaf, 20-24 oz per loaf
Slices/Loaf 20 20 26
Weight/Loaf 20 Oz/1 20 Oz 24 Oz
Price/Loaf 1.81 1.60 1.60
2 Bread, Whole Wheat, Enriched, Sliced, Wrapped loaf, 20-24 oz per loaf
Slices/Loaf 20 24 26
Weight/Loaf 20 Oz/1 24 0Oz 26 Oz
Price/Loaf 1.81 1.25 1.80
3 Bread Stick, Enriched, 2 ounces per bread stick
Sticks/Pkg 16 N/B 12 Pc
Weight/Stick 31 02/1.93 Oz N/B 20z
Price/Pkg 2.94 N/B 1.78/Dozen
Price/Stick 0.184 N/B 0.015 Ea
4 Bread Stick, Whole Wheat, Enriched, 2 ounces per bread stick
Sticks/Pkg N/B N/B 12 Pc
Weight/Stick N/B N/B 20z
Price/Pkg N/B N/B 1.87/Dozen
Price/Stick N/IB N/B 15.5 Ea
5 Buns. Hamburger, Enriched, 4 inch diameter, sliced
30 Ct 12 Pk 12 Pc
58 0z/1.96 Oz 20 Oz 1.6 Oz
3.00 1.30 1.75/Dozen
n_.mnm:wc:m 0.10 0.1083 14.58 Ea
6 Buns, Hamburger, Whole Wheat, Enriched, 4 inch diameter. sliced
Buns/Pkg 8 Pk 12 Pk 12 Pc
Weight/Bun 15 02/1.87 Oz 22 0z 1.75 Oz
Price/Pkg 1.54 1.30 2.00/Dozen
Price/Bun 0.193 0.1083 16.6 Ea




BID NO. 09/10-736

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA

BREAD FOR CHAMP'S CAFE

DUE/OPEN: May 26, 2010, 1:30 P.M.

ITEM Flowers Baking Co. of
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION Bradenton Interstate Bakeries Corp St. Armands Baking Company
7 Buns, Hot Dog, Enriched, 6 inches in length, sliced
Buns/Pkg 16 Ct 12 Pk 12 Pc
Weight/Bun 22 0z/1.357 Oz 16 Oz 1.8 0z
Price/Pkg 1.50 1.30 1.80/Dozen
Price/Bun 0.094 0.1083 .15 Ea
8 Buns, Hot Dog, Whale Wheat, Enriched, 6 inches in length, sliced
Buns/Pkg 8 Ct 12 Pk N/B
Weight/Bun 11/1.3 0z 16 Oz N/B
Price/Pkg 1.54 1.30 N/B
Price/Bun 0.193 0.1083 N/B
9 Dinner Roll, Enriched, 2 ounces per roll
Rolls/Pkg 24 Ct 24 Ct 12 Pc
Weight/Roll 24 0z11 Oz 48 Oz 1.75 Oz
Price/Pkg 1.81 1.56 1.40/Dozen
Price/Roll 0.076 0.065 11.6 Ea
10 [Dinner Roll. Whole Wheat, Enriched, 2 ounces per roll
Rolls/Pkg N/B N/B 12 Pc
Weight/Roll N/B N/B 1.75 Ea
Price/Pkg N/B N/B 1.40/Dozen
Price/Roll N/B N/B 11.6 Ea
11__|English Muffins, Enriched, 3-1/2 inch diameter, 24 oz. per dozen
Muffins/Pkg | 6 Ct 6 Ct 6/Pc
Weight/Muffin| 12 0z/2 Oz 12 Oz 250z
Price/Pkg 2.06 1.40 1.70/6 Pk
Price/Muffin 0.344 0.233 28.3
12 |Steak Roll, Enriched, 6 inches in length, sliced
Rolls/Pkg 24 Ct 12 Pk 12 Pc
Weight/Roll 63 0z/2.62 Oz 28 Oz 26-3.0
Price/Pkg 3.18 1.80 2.73/Dozen
Price/Roll 0.133 0.1583 22.75 Ea




BID NO. 09/10-736

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA DUE/OPEN: May 26, 2010, 1:30 P.M.
BREAD FOR CHAMP'S CAFE

ITEM Flowers Baking Co. of
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION Bradenton Interstate Bakeries Corp St. Armands Baking Company
13 |Steak Roll, Whole Wheat, Enriched, 6 inches in length, sliced
Rolls/Pkg 24 Ct N/B m._‘_urm - 8" Roll
Weight/Roll 65 0z/2.7 Oz N/B 3.25 Ea
Price/Pkg 3.60 N/B 1.75/6 Pk
Price/Roll 0.15 N/B 29.1 Ea
14 |Tortilla, Enriched, 10 inch diameter
Tortillas/Pkg 10 Ct N/B 12 Pc - 12" Diameter
Weight/Tortilla| 28 02/2.8 Oz N/B N/B
Price/Pkg 1.42 N/B 3.95/12 Pk
Price/Tortilla 0.142 N/B 32.9Ea
15 |Tortilla, Whole Wheat, Enriched, 10 inch diameter
Tortillas/Pkg 10 Ct N/B 12 Pc - 12" Diameter
Weight/Tortilla 18 0z/1.8 Oz N/B N/B
Price/Pkg 1.50 N/B 4.56/12 Pk
Price/Tortilla 0.15 N/B .38 Ea
Signature Page v v v
Delivery Time 7 Days from receipt order Mon, Tues, Thurs, Fri, Sat
Certifications Re: Lobbying; Debarment & Drug-Free Workplace v v v
RICHARD B. RUSSELL NSLA CERTIFICATION v v v
ADDENDA N/A N/A N/A

The Director of Purchasing and the Director of Food Service concur in recommending Interstate Bakeries based upon usage (see attached)

who is the low bidder meeting specifications, terms, and conditions.

LYY e

Gregory Herlean, Director of Purchasing

Terri Whitacre, Director Food Service

Vendor Location:
1. Charlotte County
2. Regional (Hillsborough - Collier Counties)
3. State of Florida
4. Outside State of Florida in U.S.A




ACTUAL BREAD PURCHASES JANUARY 4, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 26, 2010

FLOWERS INTERSTATE ST. ARMANDS
AMOUNTS PURCHASED | 36,380 SLICES]|36,380 SLICES 36,380 SLICES
BID ITEM 1 SLICES/LOAF 20 20 26
HONEY WHEAT WEIGHT/LOAF 20 0Zn1 20 02 24 0Z
BREAD PRICE/LOAF 1.81 1.60 1.60
PRICE/SLICE 0.0905 0.0800 0.0615
$ 3292391 § 291040 ( $ 2,238.77
AMOUNTS |PURCHASED| 214,680 BUNS [214,680 BUNS| 214,680 BUNS
BID ITEM 6 BUNS/PKG 8 PK 12 PK 12 PC
HAMBURGER BUNS [WEIGHT/BUN 15 0Z2/1.87 OZ 22 OZ 1.756 OZ
WHOLE PRICE/PKG 1.54 1.30 2.00
WHEAT PRICE/BUN 0.1925 0.1083 0.1667
$41,325.90 $ 23257.00]| 8% 35780.00
AMOUNTS [PURCHASED| 14,768 BUNS | 14,768 BUNS NO BID
BID ITEM 8 BUNS/PKG 8 CT. 12 PK NO BID
HOT DOG BUNS WEIGHT/BUN 11/1.3 OZ 16 OZ NO BID
WHOLE PRICE/PKG 1.54 1.30 NO BID
WHEAT PRICE/BUN 0.1925 0.1083 NO BID
$ 284284 |8 159987 NO BID*
AMOUNTS PURCHASED| 12,792 ROLLS [12,792 ROLLS| 12,792 ROLLS
BID ITEM 12 ROLLS/PKG 24 CT. 12 PK 12 PC
STEAK ROLLS WEIGHT/ROLL 63 0Z/2.62 OZ 28 0Z 26-3.00Z
ENRICHED PRICE/PKG 3.18 1.90 2.73
PRICE/ROLL 0.1325 0.1583 0.2275
$ 169494 [$ 202540 $ 2,910.18

PROJECTED THREE (3) MONTH PURCHASE

$ 49,156.07 $ 29,792.67

ltems 1, 6, 8, 12 comprise 99% of total annual purchase.

$40,928.95+*

6/4/2010



