BID NO. 09/10-737

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA

MILK FOR CHAMP'S CAFE

DUE/OPEN:

May 26, 2010, 2:30 P.M.

BD APP JUN 2 2 2010

ITEM Velda Farms Dairy Fort
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION M & B Products, Inc. McArthur Dairy Myers
Vendor Location: e EE .y 2 3 2
1 [Whole Milk - 1/2 Pint
Brand Cool Cow McArthur Dairy Velda
Packer M&B Products McArthur Dairy Velda Farms
No./Case 35 50 50
Type Carton Gable Top Gable Top Paper
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B .2625 2720
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. .2268 N/B 0.2645
2 [1% Lowfat Milk - 1/2 Pint
Brand Cool Cow McArthur Dairy Velda
Packer M&B Products McArthur Dairy Velda Farms
No./Case 35 50 50
Type Carton Gable Top Gable Top Paper
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B .2300 .2503
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. .2087 N/B 2428
3 |Fat-Free/Skim Milk - 1/2 Pint
Brand Cool Cow McArthur Dairy Velda
Packer M&B Products McArthur Dairy Velda Farms
No./Case 35 50 50
Type Carton Gable Top Gable Top Paper
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B .2425 .2394
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. 0.2022 N/B 2319




BID NO. 09/10-737

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA

MILK FOR CHAMP'S CAFE.

DUE/OPEN:

May 26, 2010, 2:30 P.M.

ITEM Velda Farms Dairy Fort
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION M & B Products, Inc. McArthur Dairy Myers
4 |.5% Lowfat Chocolate Milk - 1/2 Pint
Brand Cool Cow McArthur Dairy Velda
Packer M&B Products McArthur Dairy Velda Farms
No./Case 35 50 50
Type Carton Gable Top Gable Top Paper
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B .2350 .2503
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. 0.2162 N/B .2428
5 |Lactose Free Milk
Brand N/B Mcarthur Dairy Lactaid
Packer N/B Morningstar H.P. Hood
Size Carton N/B Half Gallon Quart
No./Case N/B 6 12
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B 3.0700 2.10
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. N/B N/B 2.02
6 |Lowfat Yogurt - 6-8 oz. Ctn. Variety natural fruits added. All natural
ingredients preferred.
Brand N/B Yoplait Breyers
Packer N/B Yoplait Breyers
Size Carton N/B 6 Oz 6 Oz
No./Case N/B 12 12
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B .8000 72
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. N/B N/B .70




BID NO. 09/10-737

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA
MILK FOR CHAMP'S CAFE

DUE/OPEN: May 26, 2010, 2:30 P.M.

ITEM Velda Farms Dairy Fort
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION M & B Products, Inc. McArthur Dairy Myers
7 |Lowfat Yogurt - 4 oz. Ctn. Variety natural fruits added.
All natural ingredients preferred.
Brand N/B Yoplait Breyers
Packer| N/B Yoplait Breyers
No./Case N/B 48 36
Daily Delivery Price/Ctn. N/B .4000 .32
Option: Every other day delivery price/Ctn. N/B N/B .30
8 [Sour Cream, Cultured. No imitation, USDA Quality
approved 1 oz. individual packets preferred
Brand N/B Deans Crowley
Packer N/B Deans Crowley
Size Packet N/B 5Lb 10z
No./Case N/B 4 100
Daily Delivery Price/Pkt. N/B 5.7500 9.70
Option: Every other day delivery price/Pkt. N/B N/B 9.40
9 |Cream Cheese - 1 oz. individual packets preferred
Brand| N/B Sunny Morning Dairy Fresh
Packer N/B Sunny Morning Dairy Fresh
Size Packet N/B 10z 10z
No./Case N/B 100 100
Daily Delivery Price/Pkt. N/B .1900 19.50
Option: Every other day delivery price/Pkt. N/B N/B 19.00




BID NO. 09/10-737 THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA DUE/OPEN
MILK FOR CHAMP'S CAFE

: May 26, 2010, 2:30 P.M.

ITEM Velda Farms Dairy Fort
NO. VENDOR DESCRIPTION M & B Products, Inc. McArthur Dairy Myers
10 |Butter, Grade A, Lightly salted. Individually wrapped pats
Brand N/B Upstate Farms N/B
Packer N/B Upstate Farms N/B
Size Pat N/B .34 Oz N/B
No./Case N/B 799 N/B
Daily Delivery Price/Pat N/B .0651 N/B
Option: Every other day delivery price/Pat N/B N/B N/B
11 |Whipped Butter Substitute Spread. Individual packets
Brand N/B N/B N/B
Packer N/B N/B N/B
Size Packet N/B N/B N/B
No./Case N/B N/B N/B
Daily Delivery Price/Pkt. N/B N/B N/B
Option: Every other day delivery price/Pkt. N/B N/B N/B
Signature Page v v v
Certifications Re: Lobbying; Debarment & Drug-Free Workplace v v v
RICHARD B. RUSSELL NSLA CERTIFICATION v 4 v
ADDENDA v ve

The Director of Purchasing and the Director of Food Services concur in recommending M&B Products, Inc. based upon usage (see attached) who

is the low bidder meeting specifications, terms, and conditions.

S/

Gregory Herlean, Director of Purchasing

Terri Whitacre, Director of Food Service

Vendor Location:
Charlotte County

State of Florida

gl

Regional (Hillsborough - Collier Counties)

Qutside State of Florida in U.S.A.




ACTUAL MILK PURCHASES MAY, 2009 THRU APRIL, 2010

M & B PROD. MCARTHUR VELDA
AMOUNTS PURCHASED: 13,900 13,800 13,900
BID ITEM 1 NO./CASE 35 50 50
WHOLE MILK DAILY DEL./CTN NO BID 0.2625 0.272
1/2 PINT EOD* DELIVERY 0.2268 0.2645
TOTAL DAILY DEL $ 364875 % 3,780.80
TOTAL EOD DEL $ 3,152.52 $ 3,676.55
AMOUNTS PURCHASED: 893,250 893,250 893,250
BID ITEM 2 NO./CASE 35 50 50
1% LOWFAT MILK DAILY DEL./CTN NO BID 0.2300 0.2503
1/2 PINT EOD* DELIVERY 0.2087 NO BID 0.2428
TOTAL DAILY DEL $205447.50 | § 223,580.48
TOTAL EOD DEL $186,421.28 $ 216,881.10
AMOUNTS PURCHASED: 1,590,300 1,590,300 1,590,300
BID ITEM 4 NO./CASE 35 50 50
5% LOWFAT CHOC. [DAILY DEL./CTN NO BID 0.2350 0.2503
1/2 PINT EOD* DELIVERY 0.2162 NO BID 0.2428
TOTAL DAILY DEL $373,720.50 | $§ 398,052.09
TOTAL EOD DEL $ 343,822.86 $ 386,124.84
TOTAL DAILY DELIVERY $582,816.75 $ 625,413.37
TOTAL EOD: EVERY OTHER DAY DELIVERY $ 533,396.66 $ 606,682.49

ltems 1, 2, 4 comprise 99% of total annual purchase.

*EOD: EVERY OTHER DAY DELIVERY

6/3/2010




