BID 10/11-818

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY

SCORERS AND PRESS TABLES AND PLAYER CHAIRS

OPENS: APRIL 11, 2011 at 2:00 PM

HERITAGE GOPHER SLAM DUNK ALLIED
PRODUCT POWER AD SPORTS SPORTS SCORING
QTy RESOURCES COMPANY EQUIPMENT MARKETING TABLES
VENDOR LOCATION— 3 4 4 4 4
1 |ITEM1
LED SCORERS
TABLE
UNIT PRICE NO BID $8,500.00 NO BID $9,375.00 NO BID
TOTAL PRICE $8,500.00 $9,375.00
DELIVERY FEE $270.00 $320.00
MFG POWER AD POWER AD
WARRANTY 2 YRS 2 YRS
2 [ITEmM2
PRESS TABLE
UNIT PRICE NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID $2,900.00 $1,500.00
TOTAL PRICE $4,000.00 $5,800.00 $3,000.00
DELIVERY FEE $270.00 $300.00 $440.00
MFG POWER AD POWER AD|ALLIED SCORING
WARRANTY 2 YRS 2 YRS 6 YRS
48 |ITEM 3
BASKETBALL
PLAYER'S CHAIRS
UNIT PRICE $86.24 NO BID NO BID $95.00 $102.50
TOTAL PRICE $4,139.52 $4,560.00 $4,920.00
DELIVERY FEE $350.00 $500.00 $600.00
MFG CLARIN SPEC SEATS CLARIN
25 YRS FRAME /
WARRANTY 12 YRS 1 YR VINYL 12 YRS
1 |[ITEM 4
RACK STYLE
CHAIR CADDY
UNIT PRICE $415.16 NO BID NO BID $650.00 $805.00
TOTAL PRICE $415.16 $650.00 $805.00
DELIVERY FEE $175.00 $200.00[ INC W/ CHAIRS
MFG CLARIN SPEC SEATS CLARIN
WARRANTY 12 YRS 25 YRS 12 YRS
TABLES - $13,040.00 - $15,795.00 $3,440.00
CHAIRS|  $5,079.68 N 2 $5,910.00 $6,325.00
TOTALS|  $5,079.68 $13,040.00 $21,705.00 $9,765.00

*All prices include shipping and installation

The Director of Purchasing recommends Power Ad Company for Line Items 1 & 2, Slam
Dunk Sports Marketing for Line Items 3 & 4 as the low, responsive, responsible Bidders
meeting the District's specification, terms and conditions.

Y Lo

Gregory Herlean, Director of Purchasing

endor Location Legend:
1. Charlotte County

2. Regional (Hillsborough - Collier Counties)

3. State of Florida

4. Outside State of Florida in U.S. A




