BID NO.11/12-901

BD App JUL 2 1 2011

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY, FLORIDA

DUE/OPEN: JUNE 28, 2011

PAPER PRODUCTS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE STOCK 2PM
ITEM |ESTIMATED Dade Paper & Bag Peninsular Paper Unisource School Health
NO Qry VENDOR DESCRIPTION Central Poly Corp Company Jan Pak, Inc Office Depot, Inc. Company Pyramid |1, Inc. Worldwide, Inc. Corp
Vendor LCocafion: - 3 3 3 3 2 2 3 4
1 BATH TISSUE, WHITE, 500 SHEETS Central Poly SGA Cascade Cascade Atlas Stefco Carolina Paper
RELIABLE 4228040, CONCORD 220 TT2P86R TM1616S 4064 4299D1 250 11230 SRT2US00
100 SHEETS PER CASE 4,800 48,000 48,000 550/r,80 rics 48,000 48,000 48000
cs UNIT COST PER CASE $30.30 $33.01 $27.87 $38.88 $27.08 $31.50 $30.70 No Bid
2 TOWELS.BROWN MULTIFOLD, 4000 SHEETS PERICS Central Poly Stefco Cascade Cascade Cascade Stefco Caroline Paper
GA. PACIFIC 23304, BAY WEST 480, CASCADES 101751 MFN 61230 101751 167SD1 101751 61230 MF4000N
600 SHEETS PER CASE 4,000 4,000 4,000 4,000 4,000 4,000 4,000
CS UNIT COST PER CASE $14.10 $13.80 $13.89 $16.58 $14.91 $13.10 $15.28 No Bid
3 TOWELS, BROWN , 450' PER ROLL, 2000 SERIES GA Pacific GA Pacific
GA PACIFIC 34728 34726 34728
900 ROLLS PER CASE 12 12
cs UNIT COST PER CASE No Bid $33.60 $34.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 BATH TISSUE, WHITE 2 PLY JUMBO JR, 1000 SHEET/RL Centra! Poly GA Pacific GA Pacific Cascade Stefco Caroline Paper
GA PACIFIC 13728, STEFCO 13480 TTP2P1000 13728 13728 446381 13480 92004
900 ROLLS/FEET PER CASE 12 8 8 12 12 12
CS UNIT COST PER CASE $18.80 $17.33 $17.31 $25.07 No Bid $15.75 $25.27 No Bid
5 ROLL TOWELS ECO SOFT GREEN SEAL NATURAL WHITE Bay West Bay West
6 RL/CS, 4800 PER 8" ROLL, BAY WEST 31400 31400 31400
500 ROLLS PER CASE 6 6
CS UNIT COST PER CASE No Bid $28.19 $33.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 BATH TISSUE, ECO-SOFT GREEN SEAL Bay West Bay West Bay Wost
2 PLY EMBOSSED, 36 RL/CS, 865 SHEETS PER ROLL,
4" PERFORATION, BAY WEST 61990 61990 61990 61990
600 ROLLS PER CASE 38 36 36
Cs UNIT COST PER CASE No Bid $32.18 $37.54 No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid

o

Gregory Herlean, Director of Purchasing

who are.the low bidders meeting specifications, terms, and conditions.

The Director of Purchasing recommends item 1 to Peninsular Paper Company, items 2, 4, 6 to Pyramid I1, Inc., and items 3 & 5 to Dade Paper & Bag Company

Vendor Location Legend:
1. Charlotte County

2. Regional (Hillsborough-Collier Counties)

3. State of Florida

4. Qutside State of Florida in U.S. A




